@0 O} O]\| ) MARKET VALUATION REPORT.

@ REPORT SUMMARY

M
®Y CLAIM INFORMATION

Owner Panola County, Unknown
Carthage, TX 75633

Loss Vehicle 2018 Chevrolet Tahoe LS

Loss Incident Date 03/13/2019

Claim Reported 03/19/2019

o®

4y INSURANCE INFORMATION

Report Reference Number 92258709

Claim Reference FDQ2325001

Adjuster Danliel, Alex

Appraiser Mathers, Tamara

Odometer 20,224

Last Updated 03/21/2019 09:48 AM

VALUATION SUMMARY

Base Vehicle Value

Adjusted Vehicle Value
DMV FEE

The total may not represent the total of the settlement as other factors (e.g. license and
fees) may need to be taken into account.

$ 36,639.00

$ 36,639.00
+$44.75

© Copyright 2016 CCC Information Services Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Prepared for TRAVELERS

The CCC ONE® Market Valuation
Report reflects CCC Information
Services Inc.’s opinion as to the value
of the loss vehicle, based on information
provided to CCC by TRAVELERS.

Loss vehicle has 54% greater than
average mileage of 13,100.

BASE VEHICLE VALUE

This is derived per our Valuation
methodology described on the next

page.

ADJUSTED VEHICLE VALUE

This is determined by adjusting the
Base Vehicle Value to account for the
actual condition of the loss vehicle and
certain other reported attributes, if any,
such as refurbishments and after factory
equipment.
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Jennifer Stacx

From: Jennifer Stacy <jstacy@co.panola.tx.us>

Sent: Friday, March 22, 2019 11:11 AM

To: joni.reed@co.panola.tx.us

Subject: FW: RE: Travelers Total Loss Claim # FDQ2325 001

Here is the total amount for the Tahoe.

From: French,Martha A <MAFRENCH@travelers.com>
Sent: Friday, March 22, 2019 10:28 AM

To: Jennifer Stacy <jstacy@co.panola.tx.us>

Subject: RE: RE: Travelers Total Loss Claim # FDQ2325 001

Hi Jennifer,
Thanks for getting back to me.

Eval:

Base Vehicle Value $ 36,639.00
Adjusted Vehicle Value $ 36,639.00
DMV FEE +§ 44.75

Sub Total $ 36,683.75

Deductible $1,000.00

Total check amount $35,683.75

Thanks

Martha French | Total Loss Claim Professional | Claim Services
Travelers

Upstate New York Claim Center

W: (800) 662-2310 x 8498577 F: 866.422.8263

Mailing Address:

Travelers

60 Lakefront Blvd

Buffalo, NY 14202

=
TRAVELERS

If you do not hear from me within 24 hours, please do not hesitate to email my manager, Dan Libutti, at DLIBUTTI@fravelers.com

From: Jennifer Stacy <jstacy@co.panola.tx.us>

Sent: Friday, March 22, 2019 11:23 AM

To: French,Martha A <MAFRENCH@travelers.com>

Subject: [External] RE: Travelers Total Loss Claim # FDQ2325 001

Martha,
This action will be completed on April 2, 2019. Could you tell me exactly what the check will be for? This will need to be
approved in Commissioners’ Court on April 2, 2019.



